

FOOD		Item Description	Unit	Coop Est. Use	Bidder Product Brand	Bidder Pack Size	Bidder Price per unit	Bidder price per case	Bidder Product Brand	Bidder Pack Size	Bidder Price per unit	Bidder price per case	Bidder Product Brand	Bidder Pack Size	Bidder Price per unit	Bidder price per case
Category 1:	Beverages															
10010	Juice, 100% 10oz plastic bottle various flavors, 965 compliant. Reference brand: Treetop, Minute Maid	24/10oz/CS	1,600	Tropicana	24-10oz	\$0.67	\$16.04		TROPICANA	24/10OZ		\$ 18.82				
10030	Juice, 100% Juice -flavors, 11.5 oz. Cans, 965 compliant. Reference brands: Snapple, Very Fine, Welch's	24/11.5oz/CS	2,124	Very Fine	24-11.5oz	\$0.54	\$13.04		WELCHS	24/11.5OZ		\$ 11.16	Snapple	24/11.5 oz	0.581	\$13.95
10035	SPORTS DRINK, 12 oz bottle, 965 compliant. Reference brands: Gatorade, Powerade. List flavors available	24/12oz/CS	3,690	Gatorade	24-12oz	\$0.5945	\$14.27	Non-Compliant, *See flavors list	GATORADE	24/12OZ		\$ 15.16	Gatorade	24/12 oz.	0.52	\$12.39
10040	SPORTS DRINK 20 oz 965 compliant. Reference Brands: GATORADE, POWERADE, list flavors available	24/20oz CS	6,400	Gatorade	24-20oz	\$0.83	\$19.86	*See flavors list	GATORADE	24/20OZ		\$ 21.11				
10045	WATER, BOTTLED, 16.9 OZ., 965 compliant. Reference brands: Crystal Geysler, Nestle, Pure Life, Arrowhead	32/16.9oz/CS	16,832	Crystal Geysler	35-16.9oz	\$0.12	\$4.08		PURE LIFE	24/16.9OZ		\$ 3.07	Nestle Pure Life	24/16.9	0.154	\$3.70
10055	WATER, BOTTLED, 8 OZ. 965 compliant. Reference brands: Crystal Geysler, Nestle, Pure Life, Arrowhead	56/8oz/CS	16,025	Crystal Geysler	56-8oz	\$0.10	\$5.58		ARROWHEAD	48/8OZ		\$ 9.94				Pallet delivery
Category 2:	Bread Products															
20026	Biscuit dough, Whole Grain Reference Brand: Rich's, Pillsbury	214/2.25oz/CS	425	Rich's	216-2.1oz	\$0.15	\$33.21	SO	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID				
20031	Ultra Bread Bowl 55% Whole Wheat Bread, Bulk, Bowl Mini 2B Reference Brand: Super Bakery	96/2oz/CS	705	Super Bakery	90ct	\$0.32	\$28.63		RICH'S	216/2OZ		\$ 34.74				
20040	Bun, Hamburger, honey wheat 4" WG, 2 B, 1.8 oz. Reference Brand: Shannons, Goldstar	144/1.8oz/CS	6,218	Shannon's	144-1.8oz	\$0.17	\$24.94		SUPER BAKERY	90/2OZ		\$ 31.65				
20050	Bun, Hamburger, Plain, 1.0 oz. 1B Reference Brand: Shannons, Goldstar	192/1 oz./CS	275	Shannon's	192-1oz	\$0.12	\$23.70		SHANNONS	144/1.8OZ		\$ 29.00				
20055	Bun, Hot Dog, WG, 2 B Reference Brand: Shannons, Goldstar	192/1.8oz/CS	4,105	Shannon's	192-1.8oz	\$0.19	\$36.58		GOLD STAR FOODS	144CT		\$ 19.72				
20181	PRETZEL, 5 oz KING, FROZEN, >51% WG, No Trans Fats Reference Brands: J&J, Super Pretzel	50/5oz/CS	1,079	J&J	50-5oz	\$0.54	\$27.12		SHANNONS	192/1.8OZ		\$ 41.45				
20185	Roll, WG Dinner 1oz Reference Brand: Shannons, DoBake, Goldstar	192/1 OZ/CS	3,513	Shannon's	192-1oz	\$0.14	\$26.25		J & J SNACK FOODS	50/5OZ		\$ 29.89				
20195	ROLL, Aloha Dinner, WG, 1oz 1B, Reference Brand: Shannons, Goldstar	192/1 OZ/CS	306	Shannon's	192-1oz	\$0.14	\$26.53		SHANNONS	192/1OZ		\$ 26.87				
20200	ROLL, Hoagie 6", WG, no trans fats, Reference Brand: Shannons, Goldstar	108/2.25oz/CS	1,050	Shannon's	108-2.25oz	\$0.29	\$31.65		SHANNONS	192/1 OZ		\$ 29.87				
20205	ROLL, Hoagie, 4.5", 2B, Ref: Shannons, Goldstar	144/1.8oz/CS	707	Shannon's	144-1.8oz	\$0.23	\$32.82		SHANNONS	108/2.5 OZ		\$ 35.69				
20211	TORTILLAS, FLOUR, WG, 10", 2B Reference Brand: Gold Star, La Tapatia, Mi Rancho, Aranda	12/10 (120/cs)	1,684	Aranda's	12/10ct	\$0.15	\$18.06		SHANNONS	144/1.8OZ		\$ 36.94				
20215	TORTILLAS, FLOUR, 6" Whole Grain, Reference Brand: Mi Rancho, La Tapatia, Aranda, Gold Star	16/10 (160/cs)	802	Aranda's	20/10	\$0.10	\$20.81		LA TAPATIA	10/18 CT		\$ 34.71				
20220	TORTILLAS, FLOUR, 6", 1GB, Whole Grain Reference Brand Mi Rancho, La Tapatia, Aranda, Gold Star	288/CS	575	Aranda's	24/10	\$0.08	\$18.06		NO BID	NO BID		NO BID				
20221	TORTILLAS, Corn, 6" Whole Grain 1GB Reference Brand Gold Star, Mi Rancho, La Tapatia, Aranda	12/2 DOZ./CS	89	Aranda's	528ct	\$0.03	\$15.03		GOLD STAR FOODS	12/2DZ		\$ 17.88				
Category 3:	Cereals															
30005	CEREAL, BOWLPAK equals 1GB - Reference Brands: INCLUDING REDUCED SUGAR, Variety Flavors: Kelloggs, General Mills	96 / CASE	8,167	General Mills	96ct	\$0.18	\$17.66		NO BID	NO BID		NO BID				
30050	CEREAL, BOWLPAK- large bowl equals 2GB, all varieties Reference Brand: Kelloggs, General Mills	48/CS	1,475	Malt O' Meal	48ct	\$0.39	\$18.91		GENERAL MILLS	96/1.13OZ		\$ 19.08	Kelloggs	96/case	.184	17.67
30060	Cereal whole Grain Bowls equals 1 G/B, all varieties Reference Brand: Kellogg, General Mills	96/CS	5,249	General Mills	96ct	\$0.18	\$17.66		MALT O MEAL	48/1.5 OZ		\$ 20.22	Kelloggs Pouches	48/case	0.447	\$21.50
30375	Granola, LF Bulk, Reference Brand: Kellogg	4/50oz/CS	168	Malt O' Meal	4-50oz	\$9.09	\$36.36		KELLOGGS	96/1OZ		\$ 19.69	General Mills	96/case	.184	17.14
30376	Kashi, Bowl Pack, all flavors Reference Brand: Kashi Chips	96/1oz/CS	30	Kashi	96ct	\$0.29	\$28.29		FIELDSTONE	4/50 OZ		\$ 32.45	Kelloggs	4/50 oz	0.403	\$38.75
Category 4:	Chips															
40051	Rice Krispie Treats Mini Square	600/39 oz	631	Kellogg's	600ct	\$0.13	\$76.53		NO BID	NO BID		NO BID				
40060	CHIPS, FUN SIZE, (.5 oz. - .75 oz) SB 12 Compliant List flavors Reference Brand: Frito Lay	120/bag/CS	8,002	Frito Lay	120ct	\$0.14	\$16.30	*See flavors list	KELLOGGS	600/39OZ		\$ 81.82				
40065	CHIPS, LARGE SINGLE SERVE (.1 oz - 2.25oz.) list available flavors SB 12 compliant Reference Brand: Frito Lay, Munchies	64/bag/CS	4,260	Frito Lay	64ct	\$0.3712	\$23.76	Munchies	DORITOS	120/625 OZ		\$ 18.55	Frito Lay	120/case	0.134	\$16.19
40070	CHIPS, SINGLE SERVE (.75 oz - 1.5oz.), list flavors available SB 12 compliant Reference Brand: Frito Lay	88/bag/CS	1,660	Frito Lay	88ct	\$0.24	\$20.90	*See flavors list	SUN	64/1.55 OZ		\$ 27.86				
40075	CHIPS, SINGLE SERVE (.875 oz - 1.25oz.) list flavors available SB 12 compliant Reference Brand: Frito Lay	104/bag/CS	7,430	Frito Lay	104ct	\$0.24	\$24.71	*See flavors list	DORITOS	88/750Z		\$ 26.30	Frito Lay	88/case	0.237	\$20.90
40080	Chips, Tortilla, Bulk, 1" round salted Reference Brand: La Tapatia, Warnock	12#/CS	1,130	La Tapatia	12#	\$1.1033#	\$13.24		LAYS	104/1OZ		\$ 31.08	Frito Lay	104/case	0.237	24.70
40085	Chips, Tortilla Round, unsalted 1.5 oz bags. Reference Brands: Warnock, La Tapatia	120/1.5oz/CS	1,557	Aranda's	112-1.5oz	\$0.1895	\$21.23		LA TAPATIA	12LB		\$ 15.24				
40090	Chips, Tortilla Round, Salted 2.0 bags Reference Brands: Warnock, La Tapatia	100/2oz/CS	657	Aranda's	100-2oz	\$0.2978	\$29.78	SO	WARNOCK	120/1.5OZ		\$ 27.41				
40095	CHIPS, TORTILLA, TRIANGLES, SALTED, WHITE CORN, #12 BOX BULK Reference Brands: La Tapatia, Warnock	12#/CS	573	La Tapatia	12#	\$1.1033#	\$13.24		LA TAPATIA	100/2OZ		\$ 31.15				
40114	Cookie, Chocolate Chip Baked/Frozen, Whole Grain, LW, Reference Brand: Linda, Fat Cat	300/CASE	1,605	Linda's	200-1oz	\$0.17	\$34.80		WARNOCK	1/12LB		\$ 14.75				
									LINDAS	300/1OZ		\$ 44.75				

40165	Crackers, Cheese Flavor Whole Grain 1 GB, Reference Brand: Cheeze It, Pepperidge Farm (300/.75oz/case)	175/1oz/CS	1,925	Cheez-It	175ct	\$0.16	\$27.64				KELLOGG'S	175/1OZ	\$ 27.84	Cheezeit Whole Grain Cheddar and Atomic	175/1 oz	0.143	\$24.95
40170	Crackers, Cheese Flavored, Reduced Fat, 1.5 oz SB12 Compliant 2GB Whole Grain, Referenced Brand: Sunshine, Kelloggs	60/1.5oz/CS	1,336	Cheez-It	60ct	\$0.29	\$17.44				KELLOGGS	60/1.5OZ	\$ 17.45				
40175	Crackers, Flavored, 1 oz.= 1GB SB12 such as: Belly Bears (200/case), Bug Bites (210/case), Elf Grahams (150/case), Scooby Doo (210/case), Waffle Grams (300/case), Dino Bites (150/case), Sports Bites (200/case), Chocolate Bear Graham (300/case WG Reference Brand: Keebler, MUM, J&J	See Spec Description	5,967	MUM MUM J&J J&J J&J Kellogg's	300-1oz 300-1oz 200-1oz 200-1oz 200-1oz 150-1oz	\$0.1212 \$0.1212 \$0.1163 \$0.1163 \$0.1163 \$0.1815	\$36.36 \$36.36 \$23.26 \$23.26 \$23.26 \$27.23	Bear Grahams Waffle Grahams Vanilla Dot Grahams ASC Mixed Berry Grahams Belly Bears Elf Grahams			MRS. GOODCOOKIE	200/1OZ	\$ 25.06	Elf Graham Belly Bear Bug/Scooby MJM Bear MJM Sports	150/1 oz 200/1 oz 210/1 oz 300/1 oz 150/1 oz	.166 .118 .180 .119 .144	25.59 23.7 37.95 35.75 21.70
12155	Crackers, ANIMAL, 1 oz bag =1GB Reference Brands Biscomerica, J&J Ralston, Basil, Kelloggs, Austin	100/1oz/CS	265	Basil	100-1oz	\$0.10	\$10.35				BISCOMERICA	100/1OZ	\$ 10.91	Kelloggs Animal Cracker WG	150/1 oz	0.107	\$16.19
12200	CRACKERS, GRAHAM Snacks Whole Grain, 2GB, Reference Brands: Kellogg, MUM, J&J	100/1.76oz/CS	155	Kellogg's	100-1.76oz	\$0.34	\$34.06				NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	Kelloggs Crunchmania	100/1.76 oz	0.321	\$32.11
12220	CRACKERS, GRAHAM Square, 1GB, Reference Brands: Kellogg, MUM, J&J	150/3pak/CS	2,027	Kellogg's	150-3pk	\$0.10	\$14.68				MJM	150/3CT	\$ 17.73	Kelloggs Honey Graham	150/1 oz	0.09	\$13.51
40180	Crackers, Giant Goldfish Grahams, 2 grahams per pack= 1G/B WG List flavors available Reference Brand: Pepperidge Farms	300/2pk/CS	507	Pepperidge Farms Pepperidge Farms	300ct 300ct	\$0.1356 \$0.1451	\$40.68 \$43.55	MKT, Cinnamon MKT, SO, Chocolate			PEPPERIDGE FARM	300/9OZ	\$ 46.41	Pepperidge Farm	300/case	0.133	\$39.95
12376	Sunflower seed -All Flavors, 1m/ma Reference Brand: Dakota Gourmet, Azar	82/2.05oz/CS	2,113	Dakota Gourmet Azar	150-1oz 150-1oz	\$0.1675 \$0.1611	\$25.13 \$24.17	Honey Roasted Lightly Salted			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	Dakota Honey Dakota Hot	150/1oz 150/1 oz	.166 .176	24.90 26.45
40181	Grahams, Gripz, All flavors, WG 1GB Reference Brand: Kelloggs, Pop Corn Man	150ct/.95oz	2,074	Kellogg's	150-.95oz	\$0.19	\$28.80				KELLOGGS	150/9OZ	\$ 29.45	Kelloggs Gripz	150/case	0.181	\$27.24
Category 5: Condiments																	
50005	B.B.Q. SAUCE, 1 OZ CUP Reference Brands: PPI, Taste Pleaser, Heinz	100/1oz/CS	4,003	PPI	100-1oz	\$0.08	\$7.71				NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	Diamond Crystal	100/1 oz	0.096	\$9.61
50010	B.B.Q. SAUCE, 12 gm PACKET Reference Brands: PPI, Americana	200/12g/CS	4,655	Americana	200-12gm	\$0.02	\$4.53				PORTION PAC	200/12GR	\$ 5.94				
50020	JELLY, ASSORTED FLAVORS .5 OZ cup Reference Brand: PPI, 0063850	200/.5oz/CS	736	PPI PPI	200-.5oz 200-.5oz	\$0.0303 \$0.0484	\$6.07 \$9.69	120 Grape/80 Mixed Fruit 80 Grape/80 Mixed Fruit/40 Apple			PORTION PAC	200/5OZ	\$ 9.63				
50026	Marina Sauce Dipping Cups 1 oz Reference Brand: PPI, Taste Pleasers, Boscos	100/1oz/CS	1,550	Taste Pleasers	100-1oz	\$0.07	\$7.33				TASTE PLEASER GOURMET	100/1OZ	\$ 8.22				
50030	MAYONNAISE, 9 gm PACKET USDA Grade B, Extra Standard Reference Brand PPI, Americana	100/1oz/CS	5,289	Americana	500-9gm	\$0.03	\$13.30				AMERICANA	200/9GR	\$ 6.84				
50035	MAYONNAISE, REDUCED FAT, bulk Reference Brand: Kruger, Ventura	30#/BOX	450	Ventura	30#	\$0.8183#	\$24.55	MKT			CHEF'S PRIDE	30LB	\$ 19.28				
50040	MAYONNAISE, REDUCED FAT, gal Reference Brand: Kruger, Ventura	4/gal/CS	112	Ventura	4-1gal	\$5.36	\$21.42	MKT			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID				
50050	Picante Sauce Packets Medium .5 oz Reference Brand: PPI, Salsa Del Sol	200/.5oz/CS	1,169	Salsa Del Sol	200-.5oz	\$0.03	\$6.80				NO BID	NO BID	NO BID				
50060	PICKLES, Chips, DILL 1/8" thin crinkle CUT, ONE GALLON Reference Brand: Kruger, Homade, Ctyfair	4/gal/CS	206	Kruger	4-1gal	\$3.62	\$14.48				HOMADE	4/1GL	\$ 19.15				
50065	PICKLES, CHIPS, DILL 1/8" thin crinkle CUT 5 GAL DRUM USDA Grade B Reference Brand: Kruger, Homade, Ctyfair	5 Gallon Tub	257	Kruger	5gal	\$2.90	\$14.52				HOMADE	5GL	\$ 20.95				
50070	PREPARED MUSTARD, 4.5gm PACKET USDA Grade B, Extra Standard Reference Brand: PPI, Americana	500/4.5gm/CS	3,071	Americana	500-4.5gm	\$0.01	\$4.46				PORTION PAC	500/5.5G R	\$ 6.76				
50080	RANCH DRESSING MIX, EACH PACK MAKES ONE GALLON, Reference brand: Foothill Farms, HVR	18/3.2ozpk/CS	598	Foothill Farms	18-3.2oz	\$0.96	\$17.26				FOOTHILL FARMS	18/3.2OZ	\$ 18.15	Foothill Farm	18/3.2 oz	0.958	\$17.25
50085	SALAD DRESSING, ITALIAN 12 g Reference Brand: PPI, Americana	200/12gm/CS	800	Americana	200-12gm	\$0.03	\$5.05				PORTION PAC	200/12GR	\$ 6.33				
50090	SALAD DRESSING, RANCH 1.5 oz Reference Brands:Newman's Own; Hidden Valley Ranch, Taste Pleasers, Marzetti, King	100/1.5oz/CS	938	Taste Pleasers	100-1.5oz	\$0.13	\$13.23				TASTE PLEASER GOURMET	100/1.5O Z	\$ 14.80				
50091	Salad Dressing, Low Fat Organic All Flavors, Reference Brand Chelthen House Organic, Marzetti, King	60/1.5oz/CASE	256				No Bid				CHELTHEN HOUSE	60/1.5OZ	\$ 17.40				
50094	Salad Dressing, All Flavors except Ranch, Reference Brand Chelthen House Organic	100/1.5oz/CASE	220	Marzetti Marzetti	60-1.5oz 60-1.5oz	\$0.1898 \$0.1863	\$11.39 \$11.18	Asian Sesame Creamy Caesar			CHELTHEN HOUSE	60/1.5OZ	\$ 17.40				
50095	SALAD DRESSING, RANCH 12 g Reference Brand: PPI, Americana	200/12g/CS	8,893	Americana	200-12gm	\$0.03	\$5.46				AMERICANA	200/12GR	\$ 8.21				
50105	SWEET & SOUR SAUCE, Red, 12 GM PACKET Reference Brand: Double Hi, PPI, Eastern Sun	500/12gm/CS	853	Double Hi	500-14gm	\$0.03	\$15.22	MKT			PORTION PAC	100/1OZ	\$ 9.02				
50115	TABLE SYRUP, 1.5 OZ CUP Reference Brand: Flavor Fresh, PPI, American	100/1.5oz/CS	2,609	Americana	100-1.5oz	\$0.06	\$6.38				NATURALLY FRESH	100/1.5O Z	\$ 12.57				
50125	TACO SAUCE, Spicy/Jalapeno, 9 gm PACKET Reference Brand: PPI, Americana, Casasol, Salsa del Sol	200/9g/CS	148	Salsa Del Sol	500-9gm	\$0.03	\$12.69				PORTION PAC	500/9GR	\$ 11.17				
50130	TACO SAUCE, MILD, 9 gm PACKET Reference Brand: Ventura, PPI, Casasol, Salsa del Sol	500/9g/CS	2,562	Salsa Del Sol	500-9gm	\$0.02	\$9.57				SONA HOLLEN	500/9GR	\$ 10.53				
50135	TOMATO CATSUP, 9 gm PACKET USDA Grade B, Extra Standard Reference Brand: PPI, Americana, FlavorFresh, Diamond Crystal	1000/9g/CS	8,181	Heinz/PPI	1000-9gm	\$0.01	\$14.13				PORTION PAC	1000/9GR	\$ 19.01				
50136	Ranch Pouch Dressing Reference Brand: Hellman's, Heinz	2/1.5 gal	101	Heinz	2-1.5gal	\$15.61	\$31.21				HEINZ	2/1.5GL	\$ 32.33				
50137	Ketchup Pouch Reference Brand: Hellman's, Heinz	2/1.5 gal	125	Heinz	2-1.5gal	\$9.03	\$18.05				HEINZ	2/1.5GL	\$ 18.23				
50138	Pizza sauce Reference Brand: Arezzio, Packers, Red Gold	6/10#/CS	642	Packers	6-#10	\$2.57	\$15.39				RED GOLD	6/#10	\$ 26.35				

50139	Condiments, Pouch All Flavors Reference Brand: Heinz	2/1.5 gal.	155	Heinz	2-1.5gal	\$7.5600 \$15.0150 \$16.2950	\$15.12 \$30.03 \$32.59	Mustard BBQ Mayo Others avail. upon request	HEINZ	2/1.5GL		\$ 33.23							
Category 6:	Dairy Products																		
60020	CREAM CHEESE CUPS, PLAIN - 1 oz. Philadelphia, Raskas, Smithfield, Hahn, BBRIMP	100/1oz/CS	4,376	Smithfield	100-1oz	\$0.14	\$14.49		PHILADELPHIA	100/1OZ		\$ 20.60							
60026	Cream Cheese, Low Fat, 1 oz cup Reference Brand: Kraft, Philadelphia	100/1oz/CS	487	Smithfield	100-1oz	\$0.14	\$14.49		PHILADELPHIA	100/1OZ		\$ 21.95							
60040	YOGURT, FRUIT FLAVORED - 4 oz. Reference Brand: Dannon, Yoplait, Upstate Farms List flavors available	48/4oz/CS	11,404	Dannon	48-4oz	\$0.20	\$9.60		UPSTATE FARMS	48/4OZ		\$ 12.55							
60050	Shelf Stable Milk Non Fat White Reference Brand: Challenge Dairy, Gossner, Horizon	27/8oz/CS	386					No Bid	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID							
60055	Shelf Stable Milk Chocolate Nonfat. Reference Brand: Challenge Dairy, Gossner, Horizon	27/8oz/CS	400					No Bid	GOSSNER	27/8 OZ		\$ 8.81							
60060	Cheese, Parmesan Shredded Reference Brand: Arezzio, Messana, Rumiano	10# bag	936	Lakeview	4-5#	\$3.0100#	\$3.01#	MKT	GREAT LAKES	6/2 LB		\$ 45.82							
Category 7:	Lunch: Center of the Plate																		
70005	Burger, Vegetarian, 2M/MA, Reference Brand: Don Lee, Gardenburger	48/CS	1,177	Garden Burger	48-2.5oz	\$0.64	\$30.53		NO BID	NO BID		NO BID							
70010	Black Bean Vegetarian Soy, Reference Brand: Morning Star	48/2.9 oz/CS	890	Morning Star	48-2.9oz	\$0.71	\$33.89		DON LEE FARMS	72/3.2OZ		\$ 67.58							
70020	BURRITO, BEAN & CHEESE, Whole Grain, IND. WRAPPED 2M, 2B Reference Brand: Butcher Boy, Santa Fe, Los Cabos	48/6.2oz/CASE	7,257	Los Cabos	96-5.2oz	\$0.53	\$51.00		MORNINGSTAR (KELLOGGS)	12/4/2.9OZ		\$ 35.88							
70040	BURRITO, CHICKEN & RICE, Whole Grain, 2M/2B Reference Brand: JOSE OLE, Los Cabos, Santa Fe	80/CS	3,523	Los Cabos	80-6.25oz	\$0.91	\$73.11		BUTCHER BOY	48/5OZ		\$ 33.88							
70045	Burrito, Chimichangas, BEEF, 5 oz. wrapped, Whole Grain Reference Brand: Posada, Ruiz, El Monterey	24/5oz/CS	6,140	El Monterey	24-5oz	\$0.68	\$16.38		NO BID	NO BID		NO BID							
70050	Burrito, Chimichangas, Chicken, 5 oz. wrapped, Whole Grain, Reference Brand: Posada, Ruiz, Fernandos, El Monterey	24/5oz/CS	3,745	El Monterey	24-5oz	\$0.68	\$16.38		POSADA	24/5OZ		\$ 21.65							
70085	Chicken, MANDARIN ORANGE with sauce packets Reference: LINGS, Harvest Food, Chef's Corner	2/5#/CS	171	Chefs Corner	42 lbs	\$3.1147 \$3.0076	\$135.49 \$126.32	Whole Grain	LINGS	6/5LB		\$ 142.81							
70091	Chicken Kung Pao Reference Brand: Lings Harvest Food, Chef's Corner	2/5# ckn	77	Ling's	43.5 lbs	\$3.62	\$157.36		LINGS	6/4LB		\$ 131.05							
70095	CHICKEN, NUGGET, 5 pc. srvg. WG Reference Brand: King's Delight, Advance, Tyson	720/68oz/CS	2,500	Tyson	250-68oz	\$0.05	\$12.67		TYSON	6/5.46LB		\$ 56.17							
70120	Chicken, Tenders, Krunchy, Whole Grain, 2M/1B Reference Brand: Tyson Kings Delight, Advance,	432/Tender/CS	280	Tyson	450ct	\$0.12	\$53.24	SO	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID							
70125	CHICKEN, WINGS, WINGS OF FIRE, 4 pc. srvg., Ref: Tyson, Foster Farms	10#/130-170/CS or 32-42/srvgs/cs	180	Tyson	10#/130-170	\$3.2080#	\$32.08		TYSON	10LB		\$ 33.92							
70130	CORNDOG, CHICKEN, 4 OZ. CN BULK, Whole Grain Reference Brand: Foster Farms, State Fair, Don Lee	72/4oz/CS	1,984	Foster Farms	72-4oz	\$0.36	\$26.21		DON LEE FARMS	72/4OZ		\$ 33.55							
70135	CORNDOG, CHICKEN, 4 OZ CN Label, IW Whole Grain Reference Brand: Foster Farms, State Fair, Don Lee	96/4oz/CS	2,910	Foster Farms	96-4oz	\$0.41	\$39.65		DON LEE FARMS	72/ 4 OZ		\$ 36.63							
70140	CORNDOG, TURKEY STICKLESS, 4 OZ. 48/CASE CN 2M/2B, Whole Grain Reference Brand: Foster Farms, Don Lee, D	48/4oz/CS	2,125	Foster Farms	72-4oz	\$0.58	\$27.68	MKT	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID							
70190	HOT DOGS, SKINLESS, ALL BEEF, 6", 8 PER POUND, 2M Reference: Miller, Evergood, Alpine	70/CS	2,552	Miller Armour	80/cs 80/cs	\$3.0600 \$2.4400	\$3.06# \$2.44#	MKT	MILLER	10LB		\$ 31.25							
70195	HOT DOGS, TURKEY 6", 8 PER POUND, 2M Reference: Longmont, Foster Farms	10#/80/CS	1,050	Foster Farms	10# 80/cs	\$1.0520#	\$10.52		VALCHRIS FARMS	10LB		\$ 12.27							
70202	Vegetarian Taco Pocket, WG, 2M/2B, Ovenable IW, Reference Brand: Bell Tasty, Nestle's Lamb Wesson	48/CASE	560					No Bid	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID							
70225	Noodles, CHOW MEIN, WG, With Sauce packet, Vegetarian, Pre-cooked, Frozen Reference Brand: AMOY, Ling's, Chef's Corner, Fortune	4/5#/CASE	2,700	Ling's	14#	\$1.2692#	\$17.77		CHEFS CORNER	4/7.5LB		\$ 44.76							
70245	PEANUT BUTTER & Grape JELLY UNCRUSTABLES, Whole Grain, 2.8oz. wrapped Reference Brand: Smuckers, Pierre	72/2.8oz/CS	845	Advance Pierre	72-2.8oz	\$0.49	\$35.29		CLOVERVALE	72/2.8OZ		\$ 45.67							
70255	PIZZA POCKET, # 4300 OVEN WRAPPED 1.5M, 2.25 BG Reference Brand: CHEF AMERICA	24/4OZ/CS	170	Bell Tasty	60-4.5oz	\$0.59	\$35.35		CHEF AMERICA	24/4OZ		\$ 20.09							
70256	Peanut Butter and Grape Jelly Uncrustables, 4.8 oz. WG Reference Brand Smuckers, Advance	72/CASE	540	Advance Pierre	72-4.8oz	\$0.52	\$37.43		NO BID	NO BID		NO BID							
70265	Pizza, 16", WG, Rolled Edge Cheese, Uncut, Reference: Big Daddy, Piazza, Ardella's	9/pizza/CS	75	Big Daddy	9/cs	\$6.38	\$57.40		NO BID	NO BID		NO BID							
70266	Pizza, 16" Pepperoni, Rolled Edge, WG, Uncut Reference: Big Daddy, Piazza's, Ardella's	9/pizza/CS	6				No Bid		NO BID	NO BID		NO BID							
70267	Pizza, 16", WG, Rolled Edge Cheese, CUT Reference: Big Daddy, Piazza, Ardella's	9/pizza/CS	150	Big Daddy	9/cs	\$7.07	\$63.59	SO, 10-cut	BIG DADDY'S	72/5.56 OZ		\$ 62.47							
70268	Pizza, 16" Pepperoni, Rolled Edge, WG, CUT Reference: Big Daddy, Piazza's, Ardella's	9/pizza/CS	115	Big Daddy	9/cs	\$7.25	\$65.27	SO	BIG DADDY'S	9/44.78OZ		\$ 64.43							
70280	Pizza, FRENCH BREAD, 50% Mozz, 50% Chedd, 2Ma, 2GB, 1/8c Veg 6", Bulk Pack, CN LABEL, Whole Grain, Reference Brand: Red Baron, Ardella's, Piazza	60/5.3oz/CS	2,385	Red Baron Ardella's	60ct 60ct	\$0.6276 \$0.7660	\$37.66 \$45.96		TONYS	60/5.2 OZ		\$ 39.91							
70305	Taco Pocket, Turkey, 2M/2B, IW, WG Reference Brand: Tasty Nada	60/CS	2,405	Tasty Nada	60ct	\$0.59	\$35.28		BELL TASTY	60/5OZ		\$ 41.14							
70306	Taco Pocket, Turkey, 2M/2B, Bulk, WG Reference Brand: Tasty Nada	60/CS	235	Tasty Nada	60ct	\$0.56	\$33.80		BELL TASTY	60/5OZ		\$ 39.43							
70310	Grilled Chicken Patty, Whole Muscle, Reference Brand: Kings Delight, Tyson Red Label	100/2.75oz/CS	1,125	Tyson	102-2.75oz	\$0.30	\$30.74		TYSON	100/2.8OZ		\$ 33.64							
70311	Chicken Patty, Spicy, 3.23 oz. WG, Reference Brand: Tyson	150/CASE	5,370	Tyson	150-3.23oz	\$0.43	\$63.95		TYSON	150/3.23 OZ		\$ 65.88							

70315	BBQ Chicken Wings, Nonspicy, Reference: Tyson, Foster Farm	10#	25	Tyson	10#	\$3.3330#	\$33.33	SO	FOSTER FARMS	2/5LB		\$ 36.14					
70320	Rainbow Trout Treasures 155-165 pieces per case 4pc. per serving Ref: Clear Springs, Trident	10#	1,095	Trident	10#	\$1.8550#	\$18.55		CLEAR SPRINGS	10LB		\$ 21.25					
70325	IQF Breaded Lime Pollock 3.6oz Squares Alaskan Pollock, 2M Reference Brand: Neptune	10#/40 count	82					No Bid		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID					
70326	IQF Breaded Shrimp Poppers WG 3 oz=1M. 75B, Reference Brand: Neptune	10#	120	Rich's	10#	\$3.1100#	\$31.10		SPIRITED FOODS	6'/3LB		\$ 59.55					
70327	IQF Breaded Lime Pollock 1oz Stick, Alaskan Pollock, 2M, Reference Brand: Neptune	10#	418					No Bid	SPIRITED FOODS	1/10 LB		\$ 27.94					
70335	Corn Dog Minis, Turkey or Chicken, WG, 2B/2M Reference Brand: Foster Farms, State Fair, Don Lee	239-/67oz/CS	1,747	Foster Farms	239-67oz	\$0.09	\$20.40		STATE FAIR	2/120CT		\$ 38.90					
Category 8:	Juices and Frozen Desserts									NO BID	NO BID	NO BID					
80005	Fruit SINGLES, Strawberry or Peach Fruit, Frozen, 100% fruit, 1/2 cup serving Fruit Reference Brand: Wawona	192/CS	6,191	Wawona	96ct	\$0.2089	\$20.06	Strawberry, Comm. Pricing		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID					
80010	ITALIAN ICE, Cups , Fruit Juice , 4.5 ounces 1/2 cup Fruit serving, Reference Brand: Rosati, Arezzio, J&J	90/4oz/CS	1,747	Rosati	90-4oz	\$0.30	\$27.09		ROSATI	90/4OZ		\$ 29.18					
80015	JUICE 100% FRUIT JUICE, 4 OZ. 1/2 cup fruit serving, KPACK, APPLE, Reference Brand: Driftwood, CalTex, Ardmore, SunCup	96/4oz/CS	4,810					No Bid		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID					
80020	JUICE 100% FRUIT JUICE, 4 OZ. 1/2 cup fruit serving, KPACK, GRAPE, Reference Brand: Driftwood, CalTex, Ardmore, SunCup	96/4oz/CS	185					No Bid		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID					
80025	JUICE 100% FRUIT JUICE, 4 OZ. 1/2 cup fruit serving, KPACK, PUNCH, Reference Brand: Driftwood, Ardmore, CalTex, SunCup	96/4oz/CS	85					No Bid		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID					
80035	JUICE 100% FRUIT JUICE, 4 OZ. 1/2 cup fruit serving, KPACK, ORANGE Reference Brand: Driftwood, CalTex, Ardmore or SunCup	96/4oz/CS	2,138					No Bid	SUNCUP	70/4OZ		\$ 11.77					
80040	JUICE 100% FRUIT JUICE, 6 OZ. CARTON, APPLE, Reference Brand: Driftwood, CalTex, Ardmore, SunCup	70/6oz/CS	2,455	SunCup	70-6oz	\$0.16	\$10.94		SUNCUP	70/6OZ		\$ 15.24					
80045	JUICE 100% FRUIT JUICE, 6 OZ. CARTON, ORANGE, Reference Brand: Driftwood, CalTex, Ardmore or SunCup	70/6oz/CS	965	SunCup	70-6oz	\$0.19	\$13.06		SUNCUP	70/6OZ		\$ 15.24					
80050	Juice, 100% Bar. ASST FLAVORS, 1/2cup fruit serving Reference Brand: J&J	100/2.25oz/CS	273	J&J Whole Fruit	100-2.25oz	\$0.21	\$20.51		MINUTE MAID	100/2.25 OZ		\$ 22.95					
80070	JUICE, 100% FRUIT JUICE, 4 OZ CARTON, ORANGE, Reference Brand: Ardmore, CalTex, SunCup	70/4oz/CS	8,238	SunCup	70-4oz	\$0.14	\$10.14			NO BID	NO BID	NO BID					
80075	JUICE, 100% FRUIT JUICE, 4 OZ CARTON, APPLE, Reference Brand: Ardmore, CalTex or SunCup	70/4oz/CS	5,494	SunCup	70-4oz	\$0.12	\$8.71		SUNCUP	70/4OZ		\$ 10.29					
80080	JUICE, 100% FRUIT JUICE, 4 OZ. CARTON, GRAPE, Reference Brand: Ardmore, CalTex, SunCup	70/4oz/CS	3,454	SunCup	70-4oz	\$0.16	\$11.37		SUNCUP	70/4OZ		\$ 13.13					
80085	JUICE, 100% FRUIT JUICE, 4 oz. CARTON, PUNCH Reference Brand: Ardmore, CalTex, SunCup	70/4oz/CS	6,082	SunCup	70-4oz	\$0.13	\$9.02		SUNCUP	70/4OZ		\$ 10.63					
80086	JUICE, 100% FRUIT JUICE, 4 OZ ASEPTIC PACKAGING, APPLE, Ref: Treetop, Apple & Eve, Nestle, Juice Bowl	40/4.23oz/CS	15,948	Apple & Eve	40-4.23oz	\$0.19	\$7.40		APPLE AND EVE	40/4.23O Z		\$ 7.93	Apple & Eve	40/4.23	0.186	\$7.46	Pallet delivery
80087	JUICE, 100% FRUIT JUICE, 4 OZ ASEPTIC PACKAGING, ORANGE, Reference Brand: Treetop, Apple & Eve, Juice Bowl	40/4.23oz/CS	14,125	Apple & Eve	40-4.23oz	\$0.19	\$7.40		APPLE AND EVE	40/4.23O Z		\$ 7.93	Apple & Eve	40/4.23	0.186	\$7.46	Pallet delivery
80090	JUICE, 100% FRUIT JUICE, 6 OZ ASEPTIC PACKAGING, GRAPE, Reference Brand: Treetop, Apple & Eve, Juice Bowl	36/6.75oz/CS	3,303	Apple & Eve	36-6.75oz	\$0.27	\$9.70	Berry, Apple & Eve does not make Grape	APPLE AND EVE	40/4.23O Z		\$ 7.93	Apple & Eve	36/6.75	0.27	\$9.75	Pallet delivery
80095	JUICE, 100% FRUIT JUICE, 6 OZ ASEPTIC PACKAGING, APPLE, Reference Brand: Treetop, Apple & Eve, Juicy/Juice, Juice Bowl	36/6.75oz/CS	4,093	Apple & Eve	36-6.75oz	\$0.27	\$9.70		APPLE AND EVE	36/6.75O Z		\$ 10.39	Apple & Eve	36/6.75	0.27	\$9.75	Pallet delivery
80100	JUICE, 100% FRUIT JUICE, 6 OZ ASEPTIC PACKAGING, Fruit Punch, Reference Brand: Treetop, Apple & Eve, Juicy/Juice, Juice Bowl, Capri	36/6.75oz/CS	3,429	Apple & Eve	36-6.75oz	\$0.27	\$9.70		APPLE AND EVE	36/6.75O Z		\$ 10.39	Apple & Eve	36/6.75	0.27	\$9.75	Pallet delivery
80105	JUICE, 100% FRUIT JUICE, 6 OZ ASEPTIC PACKAGING, ORANGE, Reference Brand: Treetop, Apple & Eve, Juicy/Juice, Juice Bowl	36/6.75oz/CS	2,705	Apple & Eve	36-6.75oz	\$0.27	\$9.70		APPLE AND EVE	36/6.75O Z		\$ 10.39	Apple & Eve	36/6.75	0.27	\$9.75	Pallet delivery
Category 9:	Potatoes, Frozen									NO BID	NO BID	NO BID					
90015	FRENCH FRIES, 1/2" CRINKLE CUT, Oven Ready, 6/5# Reference Brands: Lamb Weston, Ore Ida, Simplot, McCain	6/5#/CS	683	Simplot	6-5#	\$0.4650#	\$13.95		ORE-IDA	6/5LB		\$ 18.75					
90016	FRENCH FRIES, Smiles, Oven Ready, 6/5# Reference Brands: Lamb Weston, Ore Ida, Simplot, McCain	6/5#/CS	976	Ore Ida	Correct size 6-4#	\$0.9329#	\$22.39		McCAIN	6/4LB		\$ 24.41					
90025	FRENCH FRIES, 3/8" GARLIC FLAVORED Reference Brands: Lamb Weston, Ore Ida, Simplot, McCain	6/5#/CS	1,060	Ore Ida	6-5#	\$0.8306#	\$24.92		McCAIN	6/5LB		\$ 27.44					
90030	FRENCH FRIES, CURLY, MILD SEASONED, 6/5# Reference Brands: Lamb Weston, Ore Ida, Simplot, McCain	6/5#/CS	720	Simplot	6-5#	\$0.7310#	\$21.93		McCAIN	6/4LB		\$ 20.59					
90040	Potatoes, ROUNDS, Reference Brands: Lamb Weston, Ore Ida, Simplot, McCain	6/5#/CS	2,555	Simplot	6-5#	\$0.4933#	\$14.80		ORE-IDA	6/5LB		\$ 18.92					
90045	Potatoes, Savory Wedges, 10 cut Reference Brands: Lamb Weston, Ore Ida, Simplot, McCain	6/5#/CS	1,836	Simplot	6-5#	\$0.6143#	\$18.43		ORE-IDA	6/5LB		\$ 22.50					
90056	Hash Brown Stix Reference Brand: Lamb Weston, Ore Ida, Simplot, McCain	30#/CS	561	McCain	22.5# 160-2.25oz	\$1.3795#	\$31.04		McCAIN	160/2.25 OZ		\$ 33.62					
90057	Sweet potato fries, crinkle, Reference Brand: Lamb Weston, Ore Ida, Simplot, McCain	6/5#/cs	225	Simplot	6-2.5#	\$1.2560#	\$18.84		LAMB WESTON	5/3LB		\$ 33.94					

90046	Sweet potato fries, Waffle, Reference Brand: Lamb Weston, Ore Ida, Simplot, McCain	6/5#/cs	757	McCain Simplot	6-2.5# 6-2.5#	\$1.4620# \$1.1880#	\$21.93 \$17.82	SO	McCAIN	6/2.5LB		\$ 23.44					
90047	Sweet potato fries, 3/8, Reference Brand: Lamb Weston, Ore Ida, Simplot, McCain	6/5#/cs	15	Simplot	6-2.5#	\$1.2913#	\$19.37	SO	McCAIN	6/2.5LB		\$ 23.44					
90058	Sweet Potato Mini Tator Puffs, Reference Brand: Lamb Weston, Ore Ida, Simplot, McCain	6/2.5#/CS	1,060	Simplot	6-2.5#	\$1.1213#	\$16.82		LAMB WESTON	6/2-1/2LB		\$ 28.20					
90059	Delii Roasters, Reference4/9/2013 Lamb Weston, Ore Ida, Simplot, McCain	6/5#/CS	1,075	McCain	6-5#	\$0.8933#	\$26.80		McCAIN	6/5LB		\$ 23.35					
Category 10:	Staples																
100000	Pan Spray Butter Mist, Reference Brand: Butter Buds, Tryson, Pam	6/14oz/CS	210	Tryson	6-14oz	\$3.22	\$19.31		NO BID	NO BID		NO BID					
100010	CONVERTED RICE, 25# Sack, Reference Brand: Uncle Ben's, Cal Rose	25#/SACK	640	Delta Star Uncle Ben's	25#	\$0.4240# \$0.9620#	\$10.60 \$24.05	MKT	UNCLE BENS	1/25LB		\$ 35.14					
100030	CONVERTED RICE, Brown, 25#, regular, Reference: Uncle Ben's, Cal Rose	25#/SACK	3,337	Riceland	25#	\$0.4904#	\$12.26		UNCLE BENS	25LB		\$ 29.77					
100031	Spaghetti Sauce Reference Brands: Red Gold, Heinz, Con Agra	6/#10/CS	448	Heinz Packers	6-#10 6-#10	\$3.6200 \$2.2700	\$21.72 \$13.62	SO	RED GOLD	6/#10		\$ 25.27					
Category 11:	Breakfast: Center of the Plate																
11006	Whole Grain BAGEL, SLICED, PLAIN, 3 OZ, 2B, Reference Brand Pangea, Lenders, House of Bagels	72/3oz/CS	279	Pangea	72-3oz	\$0.20	\$14.22		NO BID	NO BID		NO BID					
11010	Whole Grain BAGEL, SLICED, TRADITIONAL PLAIN, 2 OZ, Bulk Reference Brands:Lenders, Tony Roberts, House of Bagel	60/2oz/CS	1,480	Lenders	72-2oz	\$0.20	\$14.62		BUENA VISTA FOOD PRODUCTS	72/3OZ		\$ 17.55					
11011	Whole Grain BAGEL, SLICED, TRADITIONAL PLAIN, 2 OZ, Individually Wrapped Reference Brands:Lenders, Tony Roberts, House of Bagels	72/CS	3,960	Lenders	72-2oz	\$0.23	\$16.67		BURRY	90/2.3OZ		\$ 27.41					
11016	Whole Grain BAGEL, SLICED, TRADITIONAL PLAIN, 3.1 OZ IW, Reference Brand:Lenders, Tony Roberts, House of Bagels	72/3oz/CS	1,240	Tony Roberts Pangea	72-3oz 48-3oz	\$0.3104 \$0.2620	\$22.35 \$12.58		BURRY	72/2.3OZ		\$ 25.59					
11055	Burrito, Egg, Sausage, and Cheese, WG, 1M/1. 75GB Reference Brand:Fernando's, Jose Ole, Los Cabos	96/3.75oz/CS	2,377	Los Cabos	72-2.95oz	\$0.45	\$32.49	Wrapped	TONY ROBERT'S COMPANY	72/3OZ		\$ 23.39					
11070	Cinnamon Roll , 4 oz, WG,wrap Reference Brand: DoBake, Pillsbury, Gourmet Treats, Edner's, Great Earth, Sky Blue	36/4oz/CS	343	Great Earth	36-3oz	\$0.38	\$13.53		POSADA	48/2.7OZ		\$ 26.98					
11075	Cinnamon Roll, 2 GB, wrap, WGReference Brand: DoBake, Pillsbury, Gourmet Treats, Edner's, Great Earth, Sky Blue	30/2GB/CS	1,711	DoBake	60-2.75oz	\$0.44	\$26.14		GREAT EARTH PRODUCTS	36/3 OZ		\$ 18.41					
11121	Whole Grain FRENCH TOAST STICKS, 3 STICK=1 GRAINS/BREAD Reference Brand: FarmRich, Aunt Jem	140/CS	3,305	Aunt Jemima	180-91oz	\$0.08	\$13.62	3 pieces = 17.5 creditable grain	GREAT EARTH PRODUCTS	36/2.85OZ		\$ 19.76					
11130	Muffins, 2.25 oz, wrapped List Assorted Flavors, Reference Brand: Elegant, DoBake, Gourmet Treats, Muffin Town, Edner's, Smart Choice	72/2.25OZCS	405	DoBake	72-2.25oz	\$0.32	\$22.79	Chocolate & Blueberry	AUNT JEMIMA	180/88OZ		\$ 17.27					
20132	Muffins, 2B, All flavors,WG Reference Brand: 20th Century, Daves Bakery, Buena Vista, DoBake	48/3 oz/CASE	2,100	DoBake	60-3.1oz	\$0.3330 \$0.3841	\$19.98 \$23.05	Apple Cinnamon Banana Blueberry	DOBAKE	72/2.25OZ		\$ 25.74					
20133	Muffins, 1B, All Flavors, WG, Reference Brand: 20th Century, Daves Bakery, Buena Vista, DoBake	96/1.8 oz/CASE	662	Dave's	90-1.9oz	\$0.3538	\$21.23	Apple Cinnamon, Banana, Blueberry	20TH CENTURY	60/3OZ		\$ 28.40					
70136	Muffins, Corn 1.9 oz, wrapped Reference Brand: DoBake,Dave's, Elegant, Edner's, Smart Choice	94/1.9oz/CS	630	Dave's	90-1.9oz	\$0.24	\$21.48	Apple Cinnamon, Banana, Blueberry	20TH CENTURY	100/1.5OZ		\$ 28.34					
20060	Cinnamon Roll Dough, 2.55 oz, WG, 2B Reference Brand: Rich's, J&J	84/2.5oz/CS	650	Rich's	120-2.5oz	\$0.15	\$18.19		DAVES	90/1.8OZ		\$ 22.86					
20065	Cinnamon Roll, 2.25 oz, IW Reference Brand: Rich's, DoBake	120/2.25oz/CS	241	Simply Blue	72-2.5oz	\$0.39	\$28.22		RICH'S	120/2.5OZ		\$ 26.34					
20136	Muffin Tops, Variety Flavors, 2GBReference Brand Buena Vista, Shannons, Daves, Sky Blue	72/2GB/CASE	3,620	Shannon's	72ct	\$0.35	\$25.35		RICH'S	120/2.25 OZ		\$ 29.00					
11140	PANCAKES, FROZEN 2-GB WG Bulk Reference Brand: Aunt Jem, Mrs. Butterworth, Krusteaz	144/1.2 oz/CS	1,733	Aunt Jemima	144ct	\$0.10	\$14.40		SHANNONS	72/2.5OZ		\$ 29.43					
11145	Waffle, MINI FROZEN, WRAPPED WG, All Flavors, Reference Brand: Krusteaz, Pillsbury, Kelloggs	72ct	6,871	Pillsbury	72ct	\$0.38	\$27.42		AUNT JEMIMA	12/12/1.2		\$ 17.73					
11146	Mini Pancakes All Flavors, WG, 2GB, IW Reference, Pillsbury, Kelloggs	72 ct.	4,160	Con Agra Pillsbury	80ct 72ct	\$0.3372 \$0.3808	\$26.98 \$27.42		PILLSBURY	72/2.47OZ		\$ 29.69					
11225	Waffle, All Flavor 2.2 oz, 2B, IW Reference Brand Smucker	72/CASE	453	Smuckers	72ct	\$0.44	\$31.91	SO	PILLSBURY	72/3.53OZ		\$ 29.69					
11226	Mini French Toast, WG, All flavors Reference Brand: Kelloggs, General Mills , Pillsbury, Krusteaz	72/cs	1,394	Pillsbury	72ct	\$0.38	\$27.42		SMUCKERS	72/2.4 OZ		\$ 33.32					
11235	PANCAKE Turkey SAUSAGE ON STICK, 2.7oz Reference Brand: Foster Farms, State Fair	60/2.67oz/CS	1,082	Foster Farms	60-2.67oz	\$0.32	\$19.40		PILLSBURY	72/2.64OZ		\$ 29.69					
11250	WAFFLES, 1 GB WG, Bulk Reference Brand: Aunt Jemima, Mrs. Butterworths	144/1.27oz/CS	1,322	Aunt Jemima	144-1.4oz	\$0.13	\$18.03		STATE FAIR	40/2.85OZ		\$ 28.73					
11251	Baked Buttermilk Bars Reference Brand: Daves, Sky Blue	36/2.5oz/CS	817	Dave's	72-2.7oz	\$0.32	\$22.90		AUNT JEMIMA	18/8CT		\$ 19.84					
11270	PIZZA, Breakfast with SAUSAGE, CN LABEL, 1 M/MA, 1.5 GB Reference Brand: Schwans, Tony's, Piazza, Ardella	128/CS	1,004	Tony's Ardella's	128- 3.32oz 2.58oz	\$0.3162 \$0.4396	\$40.48 \$52.76		SKY BLUE FOODS	72/2.5OZ		\$ 25.53					
11365	Poptart, Whole Grain 1 G/B All Flavors Reference Brand: Kelloggs	12/10 ct/case	3,540	Kellogg's	12/10ct	\$0.28	\$33.20		TONY'S	128/3.31 OZ		\$ 44.34					
11378	Uber- Breakfast Bar Whole Grain counts as 2 GB Reference Brand: Rich's	140/2.5oz/CS	213	Rich's	140-2.5oz	\$0.26	\$36.08	SO	KELLOGGS	120/1.7OZ		\$ 34.09	Kellogg	12/10 ct/case	0.257	\$30.95	
11379	BeneFIT Breakfast Bars,2GB, WGAll Flavors Reference J & J	48/2.5oz/CS	4,635	J&J	48-2.5oz	\$0.41	\$19.54		RICH'S	126/2.2OZ		\$ 50.11					
11380	BeneFIT Breakfast Bars, 1GB WG All Flavors Reference J & J	48/2.5oz/CS	1,020	J&J	96-1.25oz	\$0.23	\$21.89		J & J SNACK FOODS	48/2.5OZ		\$ 20.85					
70348	Pasta/Rotini or Spaghetti WG, Dry Reference: Barilla Snacks	20#	1,309	Barilla	20#	\$0.8410#	\$16.82		J & J SNACK FOODS	96/1.25OZ		\$ 24.03					
Category 12:	Snacks								BARILLA	2/16OZ		\$ 17.90					
									NO BID	NO BID		NO BID					

12005	BEEF JERKY, ASST. FLAVORS, .9 ounce, SB 12 compliant Reference Brand Oh Boy Oberto, Cactus Jacks, Trails Best, Jack Links, Jerky John's	48/7oz/CS	357	Jack Link	48-9oz	\$0.85	\$40.56			NO BID	NO BID		NO BID				
12010	BROWNIE, CHOC CHIP, Lowfat, 2 oz. IW, SB 12 Compliant Reference Brand: Buena Vista, Dave's	96/2oz/CASE	1,548	Buena Vista	96-2oz	\$0.34	\$32.63			LINDAS	96/2OZ	\$	35.14				
12020	Cereal Bar, 1.55 oz Nutri Grain All Flavors 1GB Reference Brand: Power Ally, Kelloggs, General Mills	96/1.3oz/CS	1,574	Kellogg's	96ct	\$0.28	\$26.40			KELLOGGS	96/1.55OZ	\$	27.27	Kelloggs Nutrigrain	96/1.55	0.259	\$24.95
12025	Chewy Breakfast Bar, 1GB, 1/2 cup fruit serving, WG Reference Brand: Fat Cat	125/1.4oz/CS	695	Fat Cat	136-2.8oz	\$0.4338	\$59.00	Apple Oat Chewy		FAT CAT SCONES	136/2.8OZ	\$	63.41				
12030	Cereal Bar/Granola, 1GB, WG, Reference Brand: General Mills, Kelloggs	96/1.3oz/CS	143	General Mills	136-2.8oz	\$0.4455	\$60.59	Cocoa Chewy		KELLOGGS	96/1.27OZ	\$	25.91	Kelloggs	96/1.3 oz	0.262	\$25.20
12055	Snack Mix 1.7 oz List available SB 12 compliant flavors, Reference Brands: General Mills, Chex Mix, Quaker	60/1.75oz/CS	1,770	Chex Mix	96ct	\$0.33	\$19.59	Strawberry, Cheddar, Chocolate, H		GENERAL MILLS	60/1.75OZ	\$	20.91	General Mills Simply Chex	60/93 oz	0.315	\$18.95
12125	CORN NUTS, ASST. Flavors, 9 OZ SB 12 Compliant Reference Brand: Kraft, Cornuts	288/9oz/CS	250							KRAFT	144/1.4OZ	\$	48.47				
12305	Fruit Juice Nugget Snacks in Pouches, Asst. Flavors, 5 oz. SB 12 Compliant Reference Brand: Florida Natural, General Mills, Ausome Fruit	200/5oz/CS	440							NO BID	NO BID		NO BID	Rico's	96/case	0.292	\$28.10
12330	POPCORN, CHEESE, 1.5 OZ SB 12 Compliant Reference Brand: Snack King, Smartfood	24/1.5oz/CASE	436	Smart Food	64-1oz	\$0.41	\$26.07	SO		NO BID	NO BID		NO BID				
Category 13:	Miscellaneous									NO BID	NO BID		NO BID				
13246	Pepperoni, sliced Reference Brand: Arezzio, Carando, Hormel	2/12.5#/CS	1,390	Tyson	2-12.5#	\$2.4112#	\$60.28			FARMLAND	1/10LB	\$	36.02				
13280	CROUTONS, 1/2oz = 1/2 G/B, Classic Seasoning no Transfats Reference Brands: Marzetti, Sugar Foods	250/25oz/CS	626	Sugar Foods	250-.25oz	\$0.07	\$16.60	MKT		FRESH GOURMET	250/25OZ	\$	17.33				
13285	CROUTONS, FLAVORED, BULK Reference Brands: Sugar Foods, marzetti	10lb/CS	173	Marzetti	10#	\$1.8250#	\$18.25			SUGAR FOODS	4/2.5LB	\$	21.31				
PAPER										NO BID	NO BID		NO BID				
Category 1:	Paper									NO BID	NO BID		NO BID				
1010	BAG, BROWN, #6 STANDARD SIZE 6" x 3-5/8" x11" Duro #6 Weyerhaeuser or equal	4/500/bale	209	Bagcraft	500ct	\$0.02	\$8.23	MKT		NO BID	NO BID		NO BID				
1040	CONTAINER, OVENABLE, ONE COMPARTMENT Size: 5" x 6 1/2" x 1 7/32" Reference to: Pactiv, Paper Tec, Monohan, ParPack, Oliver	900/CS	850							NO BID	NO BID		NO BID				
1050	CONTAINER, OVENABLE, TWO COMPT: HAMB Size: 5" x 6 1/2" x 1 7/32" Reference to: Pactiv or Tac #400 or equal	1000/CS	150							NO BID	NO BID		NO BID				
1060	CUP, PAPER, COLD, COATED, 5 OZ. State Brand and pack size. 1070 Cup, Fry, Munchie Ref: Swt GF35-0065 or equal	1000/CS	128							NO BID	NO BID		NO BID				
1070	Cup, Fry, Munchie Ref: Swt GF35-0065 or equal	1000/CS	128							NO BID	NO BID		NO BID				
1071	Cup, Fry, Munchie w/Flap Folds Reference Sweetheart LINER, PARCHMENT, FOR BAKING PANS 16-3/8" X 24" MUST BE PACKAGED IN DISPENSER BOX Ref: PAPERCON25Q1 or equal	100/CASE	5							NO BID	NO BID		NO BID				
1100	NAPKINS, PAPER, EMBOSSED, BROWN 8" X 13-1/2" Recycled paper REF: James River SCA D 3056E, NAT, Tork, Hynap	10000/CS	213	Begonia	6000ct	\$0.01	\$33.21	MKT		NO BID	NO BID		NO BID				
1180	TRAY, PAPER, CARRYOUT, LOCKED CORNER, MY PLATE LOGO 5 x 8 X 2 REF: Golden West Golden West, item KMA582CN	4/125/CS	19,089	Golden West	4-125ct	\$0.03	\$14.44			NO BID	NO BID		NO BID				
1185	Pagoda Food Pail, NO Handle, 16 oz, Reference Brand: Foldpak, Golden West	500/CASE	555	Golden West	500ct	\$0.05	\$24.72			NO BID	NO BID		NO BID				
1190	TRAY, FOOD, 4 OZ 3 3/64" X 1 13/16" X 1 1/8" Laminated REF: DOPACO #5811, BASKETWEAVE	4/250/CS	133	Southern	4-250ct	\$0.01	\$11.52	MKT		NO BID	NO BID		NO BID				
1200	TRAY, FOOD, 6 OZ 3 35/64" X 2" X 1 7/16" Laminated REF: DOPACO #5802, BASKET WEAVE	4/250/CS	630	Southern	4-250ct	\$0.01	\$12.02	MKT		NO BID	NO BID		NO BID				
1210	TRAY, FOOD, 8OZ 3 35/64" X 2" X 1 7/16" Laminated REF: DOPACO #5803, BASKETWEAVE	4/250/CS	169	Southern	4-250ct	\$0.01	\$12.81	MKT		NO BID	NO BID		NO BID				
1220	TRAY, FOOD, 1 LB 3 15/16" X 2 7/16" X 1 9/16" Laminated REF: DOPACO #5804, BASKETWEAVE	2/250/CS	750	Golden West	4-250ct	\$0.01	\$12.89			NO BID	NO BID		NO BID				
1230	TRAY, FOOD, 2 LB 4 3/16" X 2 7/8" X 1 11/16" Laminated REF: DOPACO #5814, BASKETWEAVE	2/250/CS	2,380	Golden West	4-250ct	\$0.01	\$14.23			NO BID	NO BID		NO BID				
1240	TRAY, FOOD, 2.5 LB 5" X 3" X 1.75" Laminated REF: DOPACO, BASKETWEAVE #5813	2/250/CS	210	Southern	2-250ct	\$0.02	\$12.35	MKT		NO BID	NO BID		NO BID				
1250	TRAY, FOOD, 3 LB 5 3/8" X 3 3/8" X 2" Laminated REF: DOPACO #5815	2/250/CS	1,325	Golden West	2-250ct	\$0.02	\$11.82			NO BID	NO BID		NO BID				
1260	WRAP SHEETS, Tissue, DRY WAX, 12" x 12" Ref. Dixie FS 1212W White Slate pack size	5/1000/CS	517	Paterson	5-1000ct	\$0.01	\$58.28	MKT		NO BID	NO BID		NO BID				
1300	WRAP, TISSUE, FLAT, BAKERY, IN SADDLEBACK DISPENSER CARTONS 6" X 6" REF: PAPERCON T66 or equal	6/1000/CS	64	Dixie	12-1000ct	\$0.01	\$95.38	MKT		NO BID	NO BID		NO BID				
1310	WRAP, TISSUE, HEAVY WEIGHT, INTERFOLDED, DRY WAX, 10" X 10-3/4" REF: PAPERCON WF10 or equal	12/500/CS	420	Boardwalk	12-500ct	\$0.01	\$42.16	MKT		NO BID	NO BID		NO BID				
1320	Pizza Box Recycled paper brown 16"x1 5/8 corrugated Ref: Bayline	50/CS	14	Packers	50ct	\$0.34	\$16.87	MKT		NO BID	NO BID		NO BID				
1325	Pizza Box Recycled paper brown 7"x1 5/8 corrugated Ref: Bayline	50/CS	75							NO BID	NO BID		NO BID				
Category 2:	Plastic									NO BID	NO BID		NO BID				
2000	BAG, BUN PAN RACK COVER, 52" x 80" HIGH MOLECULAR, HIGH DENSITY POLYETHYLENE, .6 MIL. Reference Brands: Handguard RP 8052 Elkay #5280, Primesource or equal State pack size	50/CS	906	IBS	50ct	\$0.40	\$20.11	MKT, SO		NO BID	NO BID		NO BID				

2050	BAG, SANDWICH, COLD, CLEAR WITH 1-3/4" FLIP LOCK TOP, 6-1/2" x 7" .6 MIL HIGH MOLECULAR, HIGH DENSITY POLYETHYLENE Reference Brands: TUFFGARDS SB8.5, Elkay	2000/CS	180	Packers	2000ct	\$0.00	\$7.64	MKT	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID							
2060	BOWL, PLASTIC, CRYSTAL CUT DESIGN, 24 oz Reference Brands: SWEETHEART CRS24X or DART #C24B	500/CS	7	Dart	252ct	\$0.16	\$39.78	SO	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID							
2090	Container, Hinged lid, Clear, 5 X 5 X3. Reference Brands: Pactiv - C18-1050	500/CS	307	Pactiv	375ct	\$0.08	\$29.67	SO	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID							
2100	Container, Hinged lid, 5-3/4 X 6 X 3. Reference Brands: Pactiv - 94160	500/CS	245	GenPac	500ct	\$0.05	\$22.70	SO	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID							
2110	CONTAINER, BLACK & transparent hinged lid octa view #0865-612 7.5" x 3"	120/CS	190					No Bid	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID							
2120	CUP, PLASTIC, SOUFFLE, 2 OZ. Reference Brands: Solo B200, I PACK	2500/CS	163	Dart	2500ct	\$0.01	\$21.48		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID							
2120	CUP LID, PLASTIC, for 2 oz. SOUFFLE Cup PL2. Reference Brands: Lid for Solo B200, I PACK	2500/CS	170	Dart	2500ct	\$0.01	\$19.73		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID							
2130	CUP, PLASTIC, SQUAT, 4 OZ. MUST FIT ITEM 10530b Solo P400. Reference Brands: Solo, I Pack	2500/CS	96	Dart	2500ct	\$0.01	\$33.68		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID							
2130	CUP LID, PLASTIC, FOR SQUAT 4 OZ. CUP MUST FIT ITEM 10530a Solo PL4. Reference Brands: Solo, I Pack	2500/CS	100	Dart	2500ct	\$0.01	\$32.67		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID							
2140	CUP, PLASTIC CLEAR 12 OZ squat REF: DART #12 CS SOLO TP12 12-14 oz clear. Reference Brands: SOLO I PACK	1000/CS	31	Dart	1000ct	\$0.05	\$48.37	SO	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID							
2140	CUP LID, PLASTIC, CLEAR DOME, NO HOLE MUST FIT # DART # 12 CS and 12C Reference Brands : DART #16LCD SOLO DN662 fits TP12	1000/CS	30	Dart	1000ct	\$0.04	\$42.93	SO	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID							
2150	12oz CLEAR CUP TALL Reference Brands: DART #12C, Solo CD12T	1000/CS	340	Dart	1000ct	\$0.06	\$56.14	SO	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID							
2150	CUP LID, PLASTIC W/HOLE MUST FIT #12CS and #12C. Reference Brands: DART # 16LCDH Solo LC14131	1000/CS	390	Dart	1000ct	\$0.07	\$66.51	SO	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID							
2160	CUTLERY KIT, SPORK PACKET, POLYPROPYLENE, SEALED IN CLEAR FOOD GRADE PLASTIC, INCLUDES 5 1/2" MEDIUM WEIGHT SPORK & 5 1/2" Milk STRAW MADE OF FOOD GRADE PLASTIC IN WHITE WITH COLORED STRIPE ACCEPTABLE, AND FULLY EMBOSSED 10"x10" NAPKIN	1000/CS	12,866	Danco Danco	1000ct 1000ct	\$0.0107 \$0.0108	\$10.71 \$10.88	8x10 Napkin 10x10 Napkin	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID							
2170	CUTLERY KIT, SPIKE PACKET, POLYPROPYLENE, SEALED IN CLEAR FOOD GRADE PLASTIC, INCLUDES 5 1/2" LONG MEDIUM WEIGHT SPORK, REGULAR SPIKE STRAW, APPROX. LENGTH 5 1/4", STRENGTH AND RIGIDITY OF STRAW TO BE SUFFICIENT TO PUNCTURE A PLASTIC MILK/JUICE POUCH	1000/CS	4,301	Danco Danco	1000ct 1000ct	\$0.0107 \$0.0108	\$10.71 \$10.88	8x10 Napkin 10x10 Napkin	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID							
2180	CUTLERY KIT, SPIKE STRAW AND NAPKIN PACKET APPROX:5-3/4" STRAW, 10" x 10" NAPKIN STRENGTH AND RIGIDITY OF STRAW TO BE SUFFICIENT TO PUNCTURE A PLASTIC MILK/JUICE POUCH	2000/CS	1,189	Danco	2000ct	\$0.01	\$10.04		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID							
2190	CUTLERY KIT, FORK PACKET, Polypropylene, SEALED IN CLEAR PLASTIC, INCLUDES MEDIUM WEIGHT FORK, SPIKED STRAW AND FULLY EMBOSSED 10" x 10" NAPKIN STRENGTH AND RIGIDITY OF STRAW TO BE SUFFICIENT TO PUNCTURE A PLASTIC MILK/JUICE POUCH	1000/CS	1,015	Danco	1000ct	\$0.01	\$11.92		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID							
2200	CUTLERY, FORK, Polypropylene, MEDIUM WEIGHT, BULK PACK APPROX: 6", WHITE. Reference Brands: DART F6BW, I PACK	1000/CS	721	Begonia	1000ct	\$0.01	\$5.33		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID							
2210	CUTLERY, KNIFE, Polypropylene, MEDIUM WEIGHT, BULK PACK APPROX: 6", WHITE Reference Brands:: DART K6BW, I PACK	1000/CS	286	Begonia	1000ct	\$0.01	\$5.33		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID							
2220	CUTLERY, SPOON, Polypropylene, MEDIUM WEIGHT, BULK PACK, APPROX: 6", WHITE. Reference Brands: DART S6BW, I PACK	1000/CS	475	Begonia	1000ct	\$0.01	\$5.33		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID							
2240	FILM, PVC, PERFORATED, 15" x 15" SHEET 1100 SHEETS PER ROLL. Reference Brands: AEP 15X15 L-15 or equal	ROLL	283	Western Plastics	1100 Shee	\$0.01	\$10.79		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID							
2250	FILM, PVC, NON-PERFORATED 18" x 2,000' ROLL Reference Brands: AEP SEAL WRAP, HIVALU or equal	ROLL	486	Western Plastics	18"x2000'	\$11.87	\$11.87		NO BID	NO BID	NO BID							
2280	TRAY, PLASTIC, CLEAR, ONE COMPARTMENT 12 mil APPROX: 5 1/2" x 6 1/2" x 1-15/16". Reference Brands: PAR-PAK 21840 Case (1000) Form Plastics 6044-128500 Case (1500) Approx 5" x6 1/2"x1 7/8" 12 mil clear OPS	See Spec.	505					No Bid	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID							
2290	TRAY, PLASTIC, CLEAR, ONE COMPARTMENT APPROX. 6-1/2" x 5-1/2" x 1-3/8" 20 mil Reference Brands: IVEX #1569 PAR-PAK 21841 DART C56NT2 REYNOLDS PNT03 PACTIV C18-8063 Form Plastics 6042 128500 Case (1500) APPROX. 6-1/2" x 5" x 1-3/8" 12 mil Clear OPS	See Spec	50	Dart	500ct	\$0.05	\$24.42	SO	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID							
2320	Tray, Plastic 6 1/2 x5x1 3/4 one compartment 400 degree ovenable. Reference Brands: Form Plastics 6047-404539, Pactiv PCS5613 or equal	500/CS	72					No Bid	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID							
2345	Clear 1 Compl. 8" Sub Hinged 8 3/16x4 1/2 x2 13/16 Reference Brand: Par-Pak	250/CS	250	Pactiv	250ct	\$0.22	\$54.91	MKT, SO	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID							

										NO BID	NO BID		NO BID				
Pasta/Penne or Macaroni WG, Dry Reference: Barilla	20#	80	Barilla	20#	\$0.8410#	\$16.82											
Cream Cheese packet 1oz	100/1oz	2,640	Smithfield	100-1oz	\$0.14	\$14.49				NO BID	NO BID		NO BID				
Sour Cream, Fat Free	2/2.5#	55					No Bid										
Yakisoba Whole Wheat Noodles FF3394 Reference Brand: JSL Foods Inc	4/5#	50	House of Bee	4-5#	\$1.1825#	\$23.65	MKT, SO		JSL FOODS	4/5 LBS		\$ 20.42					
Dough, Pizza, Parbaked Whoel grain 14"	12/19oz	250	Rich's	32-17oz	\$1.31	\$41.91			RICHS	32/16,25 OZ		\$ 44.10					
Tomato Crushed Puree Reference Brand: Belorto Heinz	6/10 cans	60	Packers	6-#10	\$2.54	\$15.23			RED GOLD	6/#10		\$ 22.66					
Tostada Shell WGR 5.5 Rectangle Shell Reference Brand: Warnock	200/case	123	La Tapatia	200ct	\$0.12	\$24.57			LA TAPATIA	200CT		\$ 25.65					
Fork, Tableware HTWF	1000/case	140	Goldmax	1000ct	\$0.02	\$22.70	Heavy Weight, Bulk		PRAIRIE PACKAGING	1000CT		\$ 34.16					
Spoon, Tableware HTWF	1000/case	56	Goldmax	1000ct	\$0.02	\$22.70	Heavy Weight, Bulk		PRAIRIE PACKAGING	1000CT		\$ 36.89					
Bagel, Sliced, Plain 4oz Reference Brand: bbrlcls	72/4oz	244	Pangea	72-4oz	\$0.21	\$14.85			BURRY	72/4 OZ		\$ 26.44					
Popchips-Assorted Flavors	72/0.8oz	150	Pop Chips	72ct	\$0.55	\$39.90	MKT		NO BID	NO BID		NO BID					
Apple & Eve Fruit Punch	40/4.23oz	580	Apple & Eve	40-4.23oz	\$0.19	\$7.40			APPLE AND EVE	40/4.23O Z		\$ 7.93	Apple & Eve	40/4.23	0.186	\$7.46	Pallet delivery
Genpack 25% Post-Consumer Recycled 5-comp Tray (Sesame)		3,000					No Bid		BRIDGE GATE	500CT		\$ 64.39					
JUICE, 100% FRUIT JUICE, 4 OZ CARTON, Pineapple, Reference Brand: Ardmore, CalTex, SunCup	70/4oz/CS	148	SunCup	70-4oz	\$0.14	\$9.61	Pineapple/Orange		SUNCUP	70/4OZ		\$ 10.91					
JUICE, 100% FRUIT JUICE, 4 OZ ASEPTIC PACKAGING, Tangerine, /fruitpunch Reference Brand: Treetop, Apple & Eve, Juice Bowl	40/4.23oz/CS	1,159	Apple & Eve	40-4.23oz	\$0.19	\$7.40			APPLE AND EVE	40/4.23O Z		\$ 10.23	Apple & Eve	40/4.23	0.186	\$7.46	Pallet delivery
JUICE, 100% FRUIT JUICE, 6 OZ ASEPTIC PACKAGING, Berry Reference Brand: Treetop, Apple & Eve, Juicy/Juice, Juice Bowl, Capri	36/6.75oz/CS	113	Apple & Eve	36-6.75oz	\$0.27	\$9.70			APPLE AND EVE	36/6.75O Z		\$ 10.39	Apple & Eve	36/6.75	0.27	\$9.75	Pallet delivery
CHICKEN TERIYAKI, LINGS, TYSON #155548	6-5#/6-2#	20	Ling's	42#	\$2.9959#	\$125.83			LINGS	6/5LB		\$ 132.61					
CHICKEN STRIP, ZESTY, TYSON #419864	2-5#	200	Tyson	10#	\$2.1350#	\$21.35	Ready to cook		TYSON	2/5LB		\$ 35.80					
CHICKEN FAJITA STRIP, TYSON #351232	2-5#	30	Tyson	10#	\$3.5310#	\$35.31			TYSON	2/5LB		\$ 34.53					
AMERICAN CHEESE, SCHREIBER #6521605	4-5#/160 ct	20	Schreiber	4-5#	\$2.6800#	\$2.68#	MKT		LAND O LAKES	4/5# PCH		\$ 60.93					
SHREDDED CHEDDAR, #20844	4-5#	10	Lakeview	4-5#	\$2.7900#	\$5.8	MKT		JENNIE O	2/9.6LB		\$ 55.64					
TURKEY BREAST, OVEN ROASTED, FOSTER FARM, #2493	2-9#	20	Foster Farms	2-9# AVG	\$2.4800#	\$2.48#			TYSON	2/5LB		\$ 19.85					
CHICKEN BREAST TENDERLOIN, #10341-0928	2-5#	170	Tyson	2-5#	\$2.1340#	\$21.34			NO BID	NO BID		NO BID					

Table with columns for Vendor, Item Description, Unit, and Bidder. It lists various food items and their prices across multiple vendors including Danileson, Goldstar, Hayes, Monohan, Bunsil, P&R, Oliver, Pressed Paper, Plastic Packaging, and Platinum Packaging.

